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The long-awaited correction – but why are investors missing in action? 
 
Human behaviour rarely changes. Time and again, the financial mistakes of previous generations are repeated. 
 
All investors wait for a correction to allow them to buy high quality companies at attractive valuations, yet when 
the opportunity presents itself, many lack the confidence to act or find themselves waiting for even greater falls. 
 
However, our experience demonstrates that starting with an understanding of what one owns is the best defence 
against market folly. 
 
Take ASML, the market leading supplier of photolithography equipment for semiconductor manufacturers. The 
company was a major beneficiary of the pandemic boom, but the elevated inventories and weaker demand in the 
semiconductor industry resulting from recent economic headwinds has driven a share price crash from more than 
€700 per share in November 2021 to below €400 in October 2022. 
 
We took advantage of this market weakness to add to our position in ASML. Our analysis of the company’s 
financial results, order book strength and ASML’s dominance in the EUV lithography space (one of the most 
critical technologies required by leading-edge chipmakers) indicates that ASML has suffered from investor 
overreaction to short term market headwinds. Notably, at the time of our buying the company had a ballooning 
order book and was unable to keep up with demand. Whilst more recent financial results have calmed investor 
nerves and the shares have recovered by over 50%, we believe they still offer good value. 
 
ASML is by no means unique, and there are many other stocks which have the potential to rerate as strong 
fundamentals are priced in. Another example is Pool Inc, whose shares have in our view been unfairly impacted 
by fears that weakness in the US housing market will result in fewer pool installations and lower earnings. We are 
not debating the health of the US housing market, but our detailed understanding of the company means that we 
are aware that it is relatively insulated from this headwind given its core business is its consumable revenues.  
 
Specific examples aside, I have increasingly seen and heard comments warning that despite the steep market 
drawdown, the US market is by no means cheap. 
 
This popular point of view is supported by a price to earnings comparison to historical averages. Received wisdom 
suggests that bear markets do not bottom out at 18.5 times earnings (the recent S&P 500 P/E ratio) which is well 
above the average multiple for the S&P 500 over the last 40 years. 
 
As a bottom-up investor, my time is spent analysing specific companies rather than indexes, but in our view the 
response to this interpretation of the US market is straightforward. Multiples can provide perspective, but investors 
have a propensity to use them to draw overly simplistic conclusions. 
 
The problem lies in the fact that many investors consider a stock with a high P/E ratio to be expensive and a stock 
with a low P/E multiple to be cheap, irrespective of the company fundamentals. This approach can often be 
accompanied by a failure to understand what the right P/E ratio is and how is it derived. 
 
To work out the P/E ratio a particular company can justify, one needs to understand the relationship between 
return on capital (ROIC), reinvestment rate (IR) growth rate (g) and earnings (E) for they are all interlinked. 
 
A company’s sustainable growth rate (g) is determined by its rate of reinvestment (IR) and the returns it generates 
on the investment (ROIC) or g = IR x ROIC 
 
This formula demonstrates that high ROIC companies can achieve the same level of growth as low ROIC 
companies with a lower reinvestment rate. 
 
  



  
 

The Vice Chairman of Berkshire Hathaway Charlie Munger explains: 
 
“There are two kinds of businesses: The first earns 12%, and you can take it out at the end of the year. The 
second earns 12%, but all the excess cash must be reinvested – there’s never any cash. It reminds me of the guy 
who looks at all of his equipment and says, ‘There’s all of my profit.’ We hate that kind of business.” 
 
If the low ROIC company and the high ROIC company are growing at the same rate, the low ROIC company will 
have to retain more of its profits to sustain the same level of growth. Conversely, the high ROIC company can 
distribute more of the profits to shareholders and still grow at the same rate as the low ROIC company. 
 
The excess income the high ROIC company can afford to distribute has value. This implies that companies that 
grow at the same rate can justify different P/E ratios depending on their ROIC. 
 
For example, at a cost of equity of 10%, a company growing at 7% per annum, has an implied P/E ratio of 10.0 if 
its ROIC is 10% but an implied P/E ratio of 21.7 if its ROIC is 20%. 
 
The higher ROIC company might appear more expensive, but they are both priced to provide the same level of 
return. 
 
For the mathematically minded the formula is P/E = (ROIC – g) / ((r – g) x ROIC), but the implication of the analysis 
above is that the return on invested capital has a material impact on returns and valuation levels. 
 
McKinsey conducted a study using financial data from Standard and Poor’s, Compustat, and Capital IQ for the 
period between 1963 and 2017. They found that the median return on invested capital for US based non-financial 
companies, with inflation adjusted revenues greater than $1 billion was stable at about 10% at the turn of the 
century.  
 
Post 2010, the ROIC of these companies increased to 17%, led by growth in the contribution to the aggregate 
market ROIC from the life sciences and technology industries from 19% in 1995 to 38% in 2017. These sectors 
have been primarily responsible for the growth of overall market ROIC over the study timeframe.   
 
So whilst many market participants automatically conclude that the S&P 500 index is more expensive due to the 
higher P/E ratio, they are often not factoring in the higher ROIC. 
 
In recent years, several companies have decided to delist from UK and European stock markets to relist on the 
S&P 500 or Nasdaq, in an effort to capture the valuation premium. To their dismay this costly exercise has often 
not had the desired impact on their share prices. 
 
In our view the reason is simple…. the analysis challenges the assumption that there is a US premium. 
 
If you remain unconvinced that the P/E ratio is not the final word in investment value and returns, consider this.  
 
High quality companies within the EPIC Global Equity Fund such as L’Oréal and Pepsi could have been bought 
at P/E ratios of 281 and 100 respectively back in 1973 and even excluding dividends, would have still beaten the 
market. 
 
Over time buying quality pays. When macro-economic factors distort share prices, it should pay more. 
 
The EPIC Global Equity fund is ideally positioned to capitalise on this market opportunity. 
 
Please do contact me if you would like to learn more and I would be delighted to go through our portfolio in more 
detail and explain the material upside we see in many of our holdings. 
 
Malcolm Schembri 
Fund Manager, EPIC Global Equity Fund 
 
  



  
 

Important Information 
 
EPIC Global Equity Fund (the “Fund”) is a sub-fund of EPIC Funds p.l.c. (the “Company”), which is an open-ended 
umbrella fund authorised in Ireland as a UCITS fund and regulated by the Central Bank of Ireland. Compensation 
will not generally be available to UK investors under the Financial Services Compensation Scheme. The Fund is, 
however, a recognised collective investment scheme within the meaning of section 264 of the UK Financial 
Services and Markets Act 2000 and shares in the Company may therefore be promoted to the UK public by 
persons authorised to carry on investment business in the UK. This marketing material has been approved in the 
UK by EPIC Markets (UK) LLP, trading as EPIC Investment Partners, which is a limited liability partnership 
incorporated and registered in England and Wales under partnership OC306260 with its registered office at 200 
Aldersgate Street, London EC1A 4HD. EPIC Markets (UK) LLP is regulated by the Financial Conduct Authority. 
Distribution of this material and the offer of the Fund are specifically restricted in certain jurisdictions. In particular, 
but without limitation, neither this material nor shares in the Fund are available to US persons. 
 
This document is for general information purposes only and does not take into account the specific investment 
objectives, financial situation or particular needs of any particular person. It is not a personal recommendation 
and it should not be regarded as a solicitation or an offer to buy or sell any shares in the Fund. This document 
represents the views of EPIC Investment Partners at the time of writing. It should not be construed as investment 
advice. Any person interested in investing in the Fund should conduct their own investigation and analysis of the 
Fund and should consult their own professional tax, accounting or other advisers as to the risks involved in making 
such an investment.  
 
Full details of the Fund’s investment objectives, investment policy and risks are set out in the Fund’s Prospectus 
and Supplement which, together with the Key Investor Information Document (“KIID”), are available on request 
and free of charge from Maples Fund Services (Ireland) Limited, 32 Molesworth Street, Dublin 2, Ireland and, in 
the UK, from EPIC Markets (UK) LLP, 200 Aldersgate Street, London EC1A 4HD. Any offering of the Fund is only 
made on the terms of the current Prospectus, Supplement and KIID. A subscription in the Fund can only be made 
after the provision of the KIID and should be made solely upon the information contained in the Prospectus, 
Supplement and KIID. 
 
An investment in the Fund is not suitable for an investor who cannot sustain a loss on their investment. There is 
no guarantee of the Fund’s future performance and past performance is not a reliable indicator of future 
performance. The value of your investment and the income derived from it can go down as well as up, and you 
may not get back the money you invested. The risks associated with making an investment in the Fund are 
described in the Prospectus and Supplement but investors should note, in particular, the following: 1) Foreign 
currency denominated investments are subject to fluctuations in exchange rates that could have a positive or an 
adverse effect on an investor’s returns. There is also a risk that currency hedging transactions for one share class 
may in extreme cases adversely affect the net asset value of the other share classes within the same sub-fund 
since there is no legal segregation between share classes; 2) The Fund is subject to the risk of the insolvency of 
its counterparties; and 3) Emerging market securities are subject to greater social, political, regulatory, and 
currency risks than developed market securities. This may impact the liquidity and value of such securities and, 
consequently, the value of the Fund. 
 

 

 


